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TODAY 
 

Second day of 

the competition 

 

Opening      

Ceremony 

 

 A FEW TEAMS START BREAKING AWAY !  

 

 



“The biggest 
mistake a man can 
make is being 
afraid of making 
one.” 

 

Elbert Hubbard  

 

YOUNG ORGANISERS 

HIGHLIGHTS OF THE DAY 

H A N D B A L L  W O R L D  S C H O O L S  C H A M P I O N S H I P  R O U E N  2 0 1 6  P A G E   2  

INTERVIEW OF A YOUNG FIRST AIDER 

Can you introduce your-
self ? 
My name is Nathan Thieu-
lin. I’m 17 and my vocation-
al  school is Lycée A. Bri-
and in Evreux. I’m in year 
12 and I do studies in safe-
ty and risks prevention. I 
am a trained first aider. 

Why are you a young 
first aider ? 
Because the director of 
the UNSS asked us if we 
wanted to be part of the 
World Championship. In my 
school training, we  have to 
work with the police and 
the fire brigade. Because 

of the Paris attacks, I had 
one more training period to 
do. So, this week is perfect  
for me ! 

What in particular do you 
enjoy in your mission ?  
I like to help people. I also 
appreciate to be on the 
move, I need it and I can 
do all this in this week’s 
mission. 

Do you plan to work  in 
public safety in the fu-
ture ?   
I don’t know yet. I hesitate 
between becoming a fire-
man or a policeman. 

How do you feel about 
participating in this 
Handball World Schools 
Championship? 
It is exceptional and so 
gratifying ! I feel so im-
portant ! We are a group of 
15 first aiders aged 17 to 
20 and we are lucky to be 
here. 

 

 

 

 
Nathan Thieulin, first aider 
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GIRLS GROUP A GROUP B GROUP C GROUP D 

9 am AUSTRIA - GREECE 

17-19 

BRAZIL - CZECH REPUBLIC 

25-9 

« postponed » HUNGARY - NETHERLANDS 

32-17 

10.40 am SLOVAKIA - ISRAEL 

36-15 

SWEDEN - ROMANIA 

17-23 

« cancelled » GERMANY - QATAR 

30-4 

3 pm ISRAEL - AUSTRIA 

15-32 

ROMANIA - BRAZIL 

22-16 

BELGIUM - SLOVENIA 

4-46 

QATAR - HUNGARY 

2-51 

4.30 pm GREECE - DENMARK 

21-27 

CZECH REPUBLIC - TURKEY 

15-32 

BULGARIA - CROATIA 

19-37 

NETHERLANDS - FRANCE 

14-14 

RESULTS 

BOYS GROUP A GROUP B GROUP C GROUP D 

 DENMARK - CYPRUS 

29-14 

BRAZIL - LUXEMBURG 

37-21 

BELGIUM - CZECH REPUBLIC 

20-34 

FRANCE -  POLAND 

33-23 

 TURKEY - GREECE 

26-19 

HUNGARY - SWEDEN 

23-16 

GERMANY - ISRAEL 

27-16 

AUSTRIA - SLOVAKIA 

29-18 

  

Our young sportsmen and sportwomen in action ! The game is getting tough… Tension is in the air… And the gap between some 

teams is already widening…! 
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Fact or fiction?!  

OFF… Fun photos of the day ! 

FOCUS ON... 

The France Handball Team is the 

only one to hold the highest  

number of World Championships.   

Is it 5, 6 or 7 ?  

See you tomorrow for the answer... 

 

Three words from Poland’s left-wing : 

« Funny, enriching and incredible ! ». 

H A N D B A L L  W O R L D  S C H O O L S  C H A M P I O N S H I P  R O U E N  2 0 1 6  

About yesterday’s fact or fic�on...Yes, a kind of handball was played by ancient Greeks and Romans. 

And we found pictures of it on ancient Egyp�an tombs !  

FEMALE/MALE STEREOTYPES 

Apparently girls are more serious and   

more industrious than boys.  

They tend to have a be"er school  

behaviour too. 

Boys, do you agree with that ?  

Kacper BOGUDZINSKI 



 

TOMORROW’S MATCHES 

JOIN US ! 
  ISF WSC Handball 

http://isfhandball2016.spip.ac-rouen.fr/ 

INFO FOR TOMORROW 
 

-> 9 am - 5.30 pm : Competition 

-> to the delegations : monday morning bring your videos 
and songs for the Evening of Nations to the main office. 

GIRLS GROUP A GROUP B GROUP C GROUP D 

VENUES St Exupéry                

ROUEN 

Lenglen                        

ROUEN 

Henri Wallon                    

PETIT-QUEVILLY 

Rabelais                       

ROUEN 

9 am SLOVAKIA - AUSTRIA SWEDEN - BRAZIL   GERMANY - HUNGARY 

10.30 am ISRAEL - DENMARK ROMANIA - TURKEY  QATAR - FRANCE 

2.30 pm SLOVAKIA - GREECE SWEDEN - CZECH REPUBLIC BELGIUM - BULGARIA GERMANY - NETHERLANDS 

4 pm AUSTRIA - DENMARK BRAZIL - TURKEY SLOVENIA - CROATIA HUNGARY - FRANCE 

SELFIE 

BOYS GROUP A GROUP B GROUP C GROUP D 

VENUES KINDARENA 1000                

ROUEN 

KINDARENA 1000               

ROUEN 

Anquetil                          

DEVILLE 

KINDARENA 1000                       

ROUEN 

9 am    POLAND - SLOVAKIA 

10.30 am CYPRUS - GREECE    

12 am  LUXEMBURG - SWEDEN   

4 pm DENMARK - TURKEY  GERMANY - CZECH REPUBLIC  

5.30 pm  BRAZIL - HUNGARY   

2.30 pm   ISRAEL - BELGIUM FRANCE - AUSTRIA 

I am Neza Curk.  

I come from Slovenia. I’m 18 years old. 

I’m really excited to be here with 

players from different countries.  

My position on court is goalkeeper. 


